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In the modern landscape of gynecological surgery, the debate
between the merits of vaginal hysterectomy (VH) versus lapa-
roscopic hysterectomy (LH) often centers on patient outcomes,
recovery times, and procedural efficacy. However, an equally criti-
cal but less discussed aspect is the environmental sustainability of
these procedures.

This editorial aims to highlight the environmental advantages
of VH over its laparoscopic counterpart, advocating for a greener
approach in gynecological surgeries. VH, one of the oldest surgical
procedures in gynecology, requires minimal surgical instrumenta-
tion—typically sutures, drapes, gloves, and conventional reusable
instruments. This simplicity not only facilitates a quicker recovery
for patients but also significantly reduces the environmental foot-
print of the surgery. In contrast, LH, despite its minimally invasive
nature and associated patient benefits, requires a plethora of
equipment such as advanced energy systems and trocars many of

which are single-use, contributing to a substantial increase in
medical waste [1].

The production, usage, and disposal of these materials carry a
heavy environmental toll, from the depletion of natural resources
to the generation of greenhouse gases and the proliferation of
waste in landfills and incinerators [2]. Considering the volume of
hysterectomies performed annually the cumulative environmental
impact of choosing LH over VH is substantial. vNOTES technique,
which has become increasingly common lately, can contribute to
reducing carbon footprint by eliminating the limitations of vaginal
surgery, increasing the indications of vaginal operations, and
allowing operations to be performed at lower CO2 pressures than
conventional laparoscopy [3].

In conclusion, vaginal route offers a viable, effective, and signif-
icantly greener alternative to laparoscopy. The shift towards more
environmentally sustainable practices in gynecology is not just a
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matter of medical ethics but an urgent necessity. The choice of
vaginal route over laparoscopy represents a step forward in this
direction, aligning patient care with ecological responsibility.
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